Jackson Township Supervisors
Bid Opening/Award — HJP Swale & Grading Project
11/4/2021

Minutes

The Jackson Township Board of Supervisors Bid Opening — HJP Swale & Grading Project meeting was
called to order by Chairman Mark Major.

Members present: Mark Major, Mark Werkeiser and Donald C. Kresge Sr.

The meeting was called to order by Chairman Mark Major at 6:30 PM.

Mark Major read the bids:

The following Bid Proposals were received:

General Construction Contract:

BIDDER’S NAME &

Construction & Excavation
155 Yeager Road
Mountain Top, PA 18707

com

ADDRESS EMAIL TELEPHONE AMOUNT
Kobalt Construction sdoes@kobaltconstr | 570.895.4613 No bid received
Sheila Does uction.com
115 Dyson Road
Swiftwater, PA
Northeast Site Contractors | spokrinchak(@nesite | 570.420.2831 $128,021.00
Stacy Pokrinchak contractors.com
3240 Oak Grove Road
East Stroudsburg, PA
18302
Mitchell Knorr Contracting | Judy.powlus@gmail. | 570.759.0813 No bid received
7295 Old Berwick Road com
Bloomsburg, PA 17815
C.E. Ankiewicz ceatrucking@frontier. | 570.868.6088 No bid received

Pioneer Construction Co.
Marta Pingel

3298 Lake Ariel Highway
Honesdale, PA 18431

pecimp@ptd.net

570.647.1590

No bid received

Rutledge Excavating
Melissa Rutledge
88 Galilee Road
Tyler Hill, PA 18469

Rutexc@verizon.net

570.224.8042

$223,673.84
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BIDDER’S NAME &

Berwick, PA 18603

ADDRESS EMAIL TELEPHONE AMOUNT
CMR Construction Inc. vincecmrinc(@gmail. | 908.210.4019 $183,802.00
PO Box 1186 com
Easton, PA 18044
Columbia Excavating LLC | estimating(@columbi | 570.759.2222 $237,000.00
7398 Columbia Boulevard | aexc.com

Vincent Renda, representative from CMR Construction Inc., was present.

Mark Werkeiser made a motion to award the bid to Northeast Site Contractors conditional upon the
review and approval of Township solicitor, Todd Weitzmann and Township Engineer Michael Muffley,
P.E. Seconded by Donald C. Kresge Sr. All voted aye. Motion carried.

There being no further business, Mark Werkeiser made a motion to adjourn. Motion seconded by
Donald Kresge Sr. All voted aye. Motion carried. Meeting adjourned at 6:50 PM.

Respectfully submitted,

Renee Miller
Township Secretary
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